BID RESULTS

TOWN OF MONTEREY
CONTRACT 215 - PRUITT PUMP STATION
BID DATE: 03/31/2016

JAMES C. HAILEY & COMPANY
Consulting Engineers|

7518 Hwy. 70 So., Ste. 100
Nashville, TN 37221

www.jchengr.com
JCH PROJECT NO: 13235

BIDDER AND
IADDRESS

MADEWELL
CONSTRUCTION

854 Drake & Shockley Rd
Spencer, TN 38585

J. CUMBY
CONSTRUCTION

165 W. Broad Street
Cookeville, TN 38501

GILISPIE
CONST ENTERPRISES

157 Gilispie Road
McMinnville, TN 37110

NORRIS BROS.
EXCAVATING

1007 Rodgers Road
Crossville, TN 38572

ROY JOE ANGEL
CONSTRUCTION

195 Rocking A Farm Lane
Pikeville, TN 37367

W&O
CONSTRUCTION

PO Box 239
Livingston, TN 38570

LUMP SUM BASE BID $298,000.00 $339,000.00 $322,000.00 NO BID NO BID $290,600.00
ADDITIVE ALTERNATE NO. 1 $315,000.00 $10,000.00 $13,000.00 NO BID NO BID $40,000.00
DEDUCT ALTERNATE NO. 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ITEM 10 & 11 - PUMPS AND CONTROLS (BASE BID)

A. Hydromatic w/ Primex Controls and Danfoss VFDs $125,000.00 $93,000.00 $72,400.00 NO BID NO BID $88,500.00
B. Ebara w/ Control Systems Controls and Eaton VFDs $150,000.00 $149,000.00 $125,000.00 NO BID NO BID $134,000.00
C. Other $130,000.00 $98,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $96,000.00
ITEM 10 & 11 - PUMPS AND CONTROLS (ADDITIVE ALTERNATE NO. 1)

A. Hydromatic w/ Primex Controls and Danfoss VFDs $30,000.00 $22,000.00 $18,200.00 NO BID NO BID $23,800.00
B. Ebara w/ Control Systems Controls and Eaton VFDs $30,000.00 $28,000.00 $24,000.00 NO BID NO BID $29,000.00
C. Other $35,000.00 $22,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $25,000.00
ITEM 12.01 - MAGNETIC FLOW METER

A. Rosemount $10,000.00 $8,700.00 $4,200.00 NO BID NO BID $5,000.00
B. Foxboro $8,000.00 $7,700.00 $6,500.00 NO BID NO BID $7,500.00
C. Other NO BID $5,500.00 $4,000.00 NO BID NO BID $5,500.00
ITEM 12.02 - TELEMETRY

A. High Tide $8,000.00 $5,400.00 $4,800.00 NO BID NO BID $5,500.00
B. Mission $0.00 $0.00 $4,000.00 NO BID NO BID $6,500.00
C. Other $6,500.00 $4,500.00 $2,500.00 NO BID NO BID $5,060.00



http://www.jchengr.com/#

