QUEBECK-WALLING UTILITY DISTRICT

CONTRACT 117 - WATER LINE REPLACEMENT

BID DATE: FEBRUARY 05, 2018
BID TIME: 2:00 P.M., LOCAL TIME

CONTRACTOR BASE BID Add Alternate No. 1
G. MEEKS CONSTRUCTION, LLC
150 Meeks Mtn Lane $152,179.00 $118,261.00
Sparta, TN 38583 $104,653.00
(ph) 931-738-6234 Corrected for Errors
MOFIELD BROTHERS CONSTRUCTION, CO., INC.
644 Lebanon Hwy $216,875.00 $147,275.00
Carthage, TN 37030
(ph) 615-735-1313 (fax) 615-735-3500
MADEWELL CONSTRUCTION
854 Drake & Shockley St $223,850.00 $127.635.00
Spencer, TN 38585 $124,135.00
(ph) 931-946-7558 (fax) 931-946-7788 Corrected for Errors
JOHN T. HALL CONSTRUCTION, INC
571 Turn Table Rd $223,980.00 $124.395.00
Sparta, TN 38583 $133,895.00
(ph) 931-738-4841 (fax) 931-738-4842 Corrected for Errors
KEMP BROTHERS CONSTRUCTION
12 Kemp Hollow Lane $236,640.00 $137,675.00
Pleasant Shade, TN 37145
(ph) 615-735-9624 (fax) 615-735-9810
MIDSOUTH UTILITY GROUP, INC
902 Hutchinson Place NO BID NO BID
Lebanon TN 37090
(ph) 615-443-7322 (fax) 615-449-9597
W & W CONSTRUCTION CO., LLC
5959 Green Road NO BID NO BID
Bloomington Springs, TN 38545
(ph) 931-372-0032 (fax) 931-372-0033

JAMES C. HAILEY & COMPANY
Consulting Engineers
7518 Highway 70 South, Suite 100
Nashville, TN 37221

Phone (615) 883-4933 Fax (615) 883-4937
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