

**TOWN OF BYRDSTOWN
 CONTRACT 118 (ECD 53789-12011)
 2017 WATER SYSTEM REHABILITATION CDBG PROJECT
 BID DATE: MARCH 12, 2018
 BID TIME: 2:00 P.M., LOCAL TIME**

CONTRACTOR	BASE BID	ADDITIVE ALTERNATE NO. 1	ADDITIVE ALTERNATE NO. 2
CUMBERLAND PIPELINE, LLC. 4129 Highway 379 Russell Springs, KY 42642 (ph) 270-343-5030	\$357,299.00	\$72,716.00	\$67,193.00
FLO-LINE CONTRACTING LLC 189 Sunstar Blvd Monticello, KY 42633 (ph) 606-340-8000	\$378,350.00	\$89,660.00	\$83,360.00
G. MEEKS CONSTRUCTION, LLC 150 Meeks Mountain Lane Sparta, TN 38583 (ph) 931-808-6234 (fax) 931-657-6235	\$405,497.00	\$83,691.00	\$131,138.00
J & S CONSTRUCTION 1843 Foreman Drive Cookeville, TN 38501 (ph) 931-528-475 (fax) 931-881-1274	\$881,600.00	\$184,700.00	\$253,800.00
K. CARRENDER CONSTRUCTION 200 Ringold Road Somerset, KY 42503-4599 (ph) 606-679-2328 (fax) 606-679-0130	\$389,817.50	\$83,382.50	\$86,640.00
LORI NEAL & ASSOCIATES, INC. 80 Miller Avenue Crossville, TN 38555 (ph) 931-484-0432	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
MADEWELL CONSTRUCTION 854 Drake & Shockley Rd Spencer, TN 38585 (ph) 931-946-7558 (fax) 931-946-7788	\$655,700.00	\$146,900.00	\$179,625.00
MOFIELD BROTHERS CONSTRUCTION, CO., INC. 644 Lebanon Hwy Carthage, TN 37030 (ph) 615-735-1313 (fax) 615-735-3500	\$511,000.00	\$117,850.00	\$126,550.00
NORRIS BROTHERS EXCAVATING 1007 Rodgers Rd Crossville TN 38572 (ph) 931-277-5665 (fax) 931-277-5495	\$483,690.50	\$95,011.50	\$113,344.50
W & W CONSTRUCTION 5959 Green Road Bloomington Springs, TN 38545 (ph) 931-372-0032 (fax) 931-372-0033	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
W & O CONSTRUCTION 150 Construction Drive Livingston, TN 38570 (ph) 931-403-1000 (fax) 931-403-3888	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

JAMES C. HAILEY & COMPANY
Consulting Engineers
 7518 Highway 70 South, Suite 100
 Nashville, TN 37221
 Phone (615) 883-4933 Fax (615) 883-4937