

CONSOLIDATED UTILITY DISTRICT
CONT 518 - MORELAND LANE & TIGER HILL NO. 2 TANK REPAINTING
BID DATE: July 10, 2018
BID TIME: 2:00 p.m., LOCAL TIME

CONTRACTOR	BASE BID MORELAND LANE TANK	ALTERNATE NO. 1 MORELAND LANE TANK	ALTERNATE NO. 2 MORELAND LANE TANK	BASE BID TIGER HILL NO. 2 TANK	ALTERNATE NO. 1 TIGER HILL NO. 2 TANK	ALTERNATE NO. 2 TIGER HILL NO. 2 TANK
BROWN PAINTING 344 Bennett Road Oliver Spring, TN (ph) 865-435-0649	\$110,970.00	\$83,900.00	\$465,500.00	\$115,600.00	\$79,600.00	\$550,500.00
CIP 104 Alpha Drive Franklin, TN 37064 (ph) 615-790-8822 (fax) 615-790-8186	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
CURRENS CONSTRUCTION SERVICES, LLC 1025 Danville Road Harrodsburg, KY 40330 (ph) 859-734-5340 (fax) 859-265-5054	\$108,820.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$137,420.00	NO BID	NO BID
DITTO COATINGS, INC. 2277 Podesta Cove Memphis, TN 38134 (ph) 901-373-3744 (fax) 901-373-3772	\$57,686.00	\$28,854.00	NO BID	\$75,912.00	\$37,556.00	NO BID
HORIZON BROS. PAINTING CORP 1053 Kendra Lane Howell, Michigan 48843 (ph) 810-632-3362 (fax) 810-632-3367	\$200,700.00	\$112,700.00	\$250,700.00	\$177,900.00	\$102,900.00	\$218,600.00
PREFERRED SANDBLASTING & PAINTING, LLC PO Box 1611 Shelbyville, TN 37162 (ph) 931-685-1009	\$91,500.00	\$68,500.00	\$551,000.00	\$115,500.00	\$75,500.00	\$751,000.00
ROBINSON & SONS CONSTRUCTION SERVICES, INC. 80 5th Avenue Haleyville, AL 35565 (ph) 205-486-5763	\$79,000.00	\$59,000.00	\$232,000.00	\$101,000.00	\$81,000.00	\$308,000.00
SCOTT I ENTERPRISES, INC. 283 Horizon Hill Newnan, GA 30265 (ph) 865-803-6377	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
SIMPSON INDUSTRIAL SERVICES, LLC 226 Airport Road Waverly, TN 37185 (ph) 931-622-1418	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
W & O CONSTRUCTION PO Box 239, 150 Construction Drive Livingston, TN 38570 (ph) 931-403-1000	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
WAYNE BELT GENERAL CONTRACTOR P.O. Box 845 Murfreesboro, TN 37133 (ph) 615-896-3403	\$124,900.00	\$68,000.00	NO BID	\$140,900.00	\$73,000.00	NO BID

JAMES C. HAILEY & COMPANY
Consulting Engineers
7518 Highway 70 South, Suite 100
Nashville, TN 37221
Phone (615) 883-4933 Fax (615) 883-4937

