

TOWN OF MONTEREY
 CONTRACT 119 (ECD CONTRACT 57942-12757) - 2018 CDBG SEWER SYSTEM REHABILITATION
 BID DATE: MAY 30, 2019
 BID TIME: 3:00 P.M., LOCAL TIME

CONTRACTOR	BASE BID	ADD ALTERNATE NO. 1	ADD ALTERNATE NO. 2
BOATMAN CONSTRUCTION COMPANY, INC PO Box 968 La Vergne, TN 37086 (ph) 615-793-6721	\$413,857.50	\$87,393.00	\$187,955.00
BOBBY LUTTRELL & SONS, LLC 190 Bank Circle Drive Dundee, KY 42338 (ph) 270-276-9439	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
IPR 5207 Brer Rabbit Road Stone Mountain, GA 30083 (ph) 678-607-2161	\$599,230.00	\$143,970.00	\$345,390.00
J & H CONSTRUCTION, INC PO Box 2263 Cookeville, TN 38502 (ph) 931-528-0064	\$373,270.77	\$81,907.00	\$189,979.42
JOHN T. HALL CONSTRUCTION, INC. 571 Turntable Rd Sparta, TN 38583 (ph) 931-738-4841	\$455,085.00	\$92,754.00	\$246,500.00
MOFIELD BROTHERS CONSTRUCTION CO, LLC 644 Lebanon Hwy Carthage, TN 37030 (ph) 615-735-1313	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
PIPEWORKS PLUS, INC 147 Holloway Drive Tullahoma, TN 37388 (ph) 931-455-7592	\$392,565.00	\$80,534.00	\$215,383.00
PORTLAND UTILITIES CONSTRUCTION COMPANY, LLC 117 Demase Street Portland, TN 37148 (ph) 615-325-3374	\$479,725.40	\$96,510.63	\$234,378.60

JAMES C. HAILEY & COMPANY
Consulting Engineers
 1619 Galleria Boulevard
 Brentwood, TN 37027-2926
 Phone (615) 883-4933 Fax (615) 883-4937