

TOWN OF MONTEREY
 CONTRACT 220 - ARC WATER SYSTEM IMPROVEMENTS
 BID DATE: JUNE 25, 2020
 BID TIME: 2:00 P.M., LOCAL TIME

CONTRACTOR	BASE BID	ADD ALTERNATE NO. 1	ADD ALTERNATE NO. 2
MADEWELL CONSTRUCTION, INC. 854 Drake & Shockley Road Spencer, TN 38585 (ph) 931-946-7558	\$538,925.00	\$266,900.00	\$133,025.00
DANSON CONSTRUCTION, INC. 3536 Old Bon Air Road Sparta, TN 38583 (ph) 931-935-2005	\$465,590.00	\$227,800.00	\$106,250.00
IRONWOOD CONSTRUCTION & ENGINEERING LLC PO Box 1369 Crossville, TN 38557 (ph) 931-200-7446	\$453,250.00	\$237,675.00	\$132,250.00
MOFIELD BROTHERS CONST CO, LLC. 644 Lebanon Hwy Carthage, TN 37030 (ph) 615-735-1313	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
W & O CONSTRUCTION 150 Construction Drive Livingston, TN 38570 (ph) 931-403-1000	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
GREEN BROTHERS CONSTRUCTION 676 Bowman Loop Crossville, TN 38571 (ph) 931-484-1129	\$871,100.00	\$398,000.00	\$183,800.00
UNITED PIPELINE, INC. 150 Hill Road Tompkinsville, KY 42167 (ph) 270-487-8493	\$605,250.00	\$304,300.00	\$129,750.00

JAMES C. HAILEY & COMPANY
Consulting Engineers
 1619 Galleria Boulevard
 Brentwood, TN 37027-2926
 Phone (615) 883-4933 Fax (615) 883-4937