WARREN COUNTY UTILITY DISTRICT
CONTRACT 121 - CENTERTOWN WATER STORAGE TANK
BID DATE: SEPTEMBER 13, 2022
BID TIME: 2:30 P.M., LOCAL TIME

CONTRACTOR

BASE BID A
COMPOSITE ELEVATED WST

BASE BID B
TOROSPHERE ELEVATED WST

BASE BID A - TANK MIXING

HYDRODYNAMIC MIXING SYSTEM

BASE BID B - TANK MIXING
ELECTRIC MIXING SYSTEM

ADDITIVE ALTERNATE
3-COLOR LOGO

CALDWELL TANKS
4000 Tower Road
Louisville, KY 40219
(ph) 502-964-3361

$3,815,200.00

$3,626,500.00

$63,750.00

$24,250.00

$18,750.00

LANDMARK STRUCTURES
1665 Harmon Road

Fort Worth, TX 76177

(ph) 817-439-8888

$4,254,000.00

NO BID

$48,000.00

$16,000.00

$8,000.00

MAGUIRE IRON, INC.
PO Box 1446

Sioux Falls, SD 57101
(ph) 605-334-9749

NO BID

$3,996,200.00

$60,000.00

$15,000.00

$15,000.00

PHOENIX FABRICATORS & ERECTORS
182 South County Road 900 E

Avon, IN 46123

(ph) 917-271-7002

$4,260,722.00

$3,852,810.00

$46,402.00

$68,818.00

$8,500.00

CB & | STORAGE SOLUTIONS, LLC.
11560 Great Oaks Way, Ste 500
Alpharetta, GA 30022

(ph) 770-521-6542

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

JAMES C. HAILEY & COMPANY
1619 Galleria Boulevard

Brentwood, TN 37027

Phone (615) 883-4933 Fax (615) 883-4937
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