FENTRESS COUNTY INDUSTRIAL DEVELOPMENT BOARD
CONTRACT 124 - INDUSTRIAL PARK CLEARING
NEW BID DATE: FEBRUARY 5, 2025

BID TIME: 2:00 PM, LOCAL TIME

CONTRACTOR

BASE
BID

ADD ALTERNATE
NO. 1

ADD ALTERNATE
NO. 2

CONTRACTING SERVICES, INC.
2267 BAPTIST CHURCH ROAD
CULLEOKA, TN 38451
931-987-0515

$247,100.00

$133,000.00

$172,900.00

WEST FARMS & CONSTRUCTION, LLC.
PO BOX 92

DIXON SPRINGS, TN 37057
615-489-0689

$503,025.00

$285,000.00

$376,675.00

MARCUM EXCAVATING
206 N. MAIN STREET
ONEIDA, TN 37841
423-569-6619

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

BODOCK TRUCKING & EXCAVATING, LLC.
70 BATES ROAD

LEBANON, TN 37087

615-210-0636

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

P & L CONSTRUCTION, LLC.
6540 SOUTH YORK HWY
CLARKRANGE, TN 38553
931-863-8030

$172,200.00

$88,806.00

$115,447.80

PAVE GRADE & AGGREGATE, INC.
PO BOX 304

HUNTSVILLE, TN 37756
423-569-7424

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

TUGSON GROUP, INC.
PO BOX 3928
CLARKSVILLE, TN 37043
931-802-0132

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

TENNESSEE CONSTRUCTION LLC
2001 PEAVINE RD

CROSSVILLE, TN 38571
931-267-7530

$626,500.00

$350,000.00

$432,250.00

B & B OF TN., INC.
18231 ALBERTA STREET
ONEIDA, TN 37841
423-569-6674

$641,750.00

$185,535.00

$234,360.00

JAMES C. HAILEY & COMPANY
Consulting Engineers
360 Cool Springs Boulevard, Suite 100
Franklin, Tennessee 37067-7216
Phone (615) 883-4933 Fax (615) 883-4937
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