
CONTRACTOR BASE ADDITIVE ALTERNATE ADDITIVE ALTERNATE 

BID NO. 1 NO. 2

LAMBERT CONTRACTING LLC

PO BOX 464 $2,019,700.00 $567,125.00 $253,125.00

HOLLYWOOD, AL 35752

256-594-6850

G MEEKS CONSTRUCTION LLC

150 MEEKS MTN RD $2,094,890.00 $297,280.00 $130,780.00

SPARTA, TN 38583

931-738-6234

TIMBERLINE CONSTRUCTION GROUP LLC

77 PARDUE RD $2,369,000.00 $204,250.00 $102,750.00

PELHAM, AL 35124

205-848-8300

JOHN T HALL CONSTRUCTION 

PO BOX 960 $2,404,900.00 $235,750.00 $114,850.00

SPARTA, TN 38583

931-837-4841

MOFIELD BROTHERS CONSTRUCTION CO LLC

644 LEBANON HWY $2,660,400.00 $300,500.00 $137,500.00

CARTHAGE, TN 37030

615-735-1313

REV CONSTRUCTION INC

5801 GROVER BURCHFIELD DR $2,674,000.00 $238,000.00 $115,900.00

TUSCALOOSA, AL 35401

205-349-1860

AUSTIN CONSTRUCTION CO

1029 JUDGE AUSTIN RD $2,864,300.00 $213,750.00 $108,750.00

SPARTA, TN 38583

931-738-3292

HAWKINS & PRICE LLC

5096 HWY 64 E NO BID NO BID NO BID

WARTRACE, TN 37183

931-389-0909

HENSLEY CIVIL LLC

418 E VINE ST NO BID NO BID NO BID

MURFREESBORO, TN 37130

615-631-7539

JAMES N BUSH CONSTRUCTION CO INC

PO BOX 69 NO BID NO BID NO BID

SILVER POINT, TN 38582

931-526-3223

CUMBERLAND PIPLINE LLC

2909 CANE VALLEY MILL RD NO BID NO BID NO BID

COLUMBIA, KY 42728

270-385-9000

TWIN STATES UTILITIES & EXCAVATION INC

9186 OLD GLASGOW RD NO BID NO BID NO BID

MOUNT HERMON, KY 42157

270-427-5300

LOFTY CONSTRUCTION COMPANY

800 LOFTY DRIVE NO BID NO BID NO BID

KIMBALL, TN 37347

423-837-8403

NITZSCHKE COMMUNICATIONS INC

PO BOX 25 NO BID NO BID NO BID

SUNBRIGHT, TN 37872

423-539-8646

PIPEWORKS PLUS INC

306 STEELMAN LOOP ROAD NO BID NO BID NO BID

FAYETTEVILLE, TN 37334

931-759-4125

Phone (615) 883-4933  Fax (615) 883-4937

BID DATE: OCTOBER 30, 2025

BID TIME:  2:30 P.M. , Local Time

JAMES C. HAILEY & COMPANY

Consulting Engineers

360 Cool Springs Boulevard, Suite 100

Franklin, Tennessee 37067-7216

GRUNDY COUNTY

CONTRACT 125  - HWY 50 TO PAYNE COVE AND CHARLIE ROBERTS ROAD WATER LINE
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