
BASE ADDITIVE ALTERNATE
BID NO 1

SURREY HOMES LLC
211 COMMERCE DRIVE, STE 100
SMYRNA, TN 37167
615-809-7777
JSJ CONSTRUCTION LLC
1984 WOODALL LN
CROSSPLAINS, TN 37049
615-380-8253
WEST FARMS & CONSTRUCTION, LLC.
PO BOX 92
DIXON SPRINGS, TN 37067
615-489-0689

EXPEDITED EXCAVATION CO LLC
725 Page Avenue
Lebanon, TN 37087
615-735-7996
JARRETT BUILDERS INC
1106 Lebanon Pike
Nashville, TN 37210
615-515-1271
HENSLEY CIVIL
418 EAST VINE STREET
MURFREESBORO, TN 37129
615-631-7539
HAWKINS & PRICE LLC
5096 HWY 64 E
WARTRACE, TN 37183
931-389-0909
ADAMS CONTRACTING LLC
131 PROSPEROUS PLACE, STE 19A
LEXINGTON, KY 40509
859-629-4948
REV CONSTRUCTION INC
5801 GROVER BURCHFIELD DR
TUSCALOOSA, AL 35401
205-349-1860

GREER INDUSTRIES LLC
182 JOE TABOR ROAD
CROSSVILLE, TN 38571
931-710-5755
NITZSCHKE COMMUNICATIONS INC
PO BOX 25 
SUNBRIGHT, TN 37872
423-539-8646
HALL CONSTRUCTION, LLC
1530 ASHLAND CITY RD
CLARKSVILLE, TN 37040
931-933-0620

JAMES C. HAILEY & COMPANY
Consulting Engineers

360 Cool Springs Boulevard, Suite 100
Franklin, Tennessee 37067-7216

Phone (615) 883-4933  Fax (615) 883-4937

NO BID

CONSOLIDATED UTILITY DISTRICT
CIP 24-10-010 ROCKY FORK ROAD WATER LINE REPLACEMENT

BID DATE: NOVEMBER 4, 2025
BID TIME:  11:00 AM , LOCAL TIME

NO BID

$ 1,608,125.51

NO BID

NO BID

CONTRACTOR

$ 1,731,492.00

$ 676,995.00

$ 934,139.44

$ 2,485,300.00

$ 1,144,040.00

$ 1,379,312.00

$ 1,379,312.00

NO BID

$ 554,500.00

$ 971,292.00

$ 288,000.00 $ 975,000.00

$ 1,244,140.00

NO BID

$ 828,789.00

$ 1,431,200.00

NO BID NO BID

$ 843,015.00


