
BASE BID A BASE BID B TOTAL 

OLD HILLSBORO RD WPS WADDELL HOLLOW RD PS BASE BID A PLUS B

REV CONSTRUCTION INC

5801 GROVER BURCHFIELD DRIVE

TUSCALOOSA AL 35401

205-349-1860

HAWKINS & PRICE LLC

5096 HWY 64 E

WARTRACE, TN 37183

931-389-0909

HENSLEY CIVIL LLC

418 E VINE ST NO BID NO BID NO BID

MURFREESBORO, TN 37130

615-631-7539

CONTRACTING SERVICES LLC

2267 BAPTIST CHURCH RD

CULLEOKA, TN 38451

931-987-3014

W & O CONSTRUCTION

PO Box 239

Livingston, TN 38570 

(ph) 931-403-1000    (fax) 931-403-3888

HURST EXCAVATING, LLC

PO Box 5374 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Knoxville, TN 37928

865-922-6142

HARPER CONSTRUCTION COMPANY

PO Box 20991 $285,000.00 $490,000.00 $775,000.00

Nashville, TN 37209

864-412-6517

JARRETT BUILDERS INC

1106 LEBANON PIKE $290,475.00 $404,450.00 $694,925.00

NASHVILLE, TN 37210

615-515-1270

CONTRACTOR

$346,082.00

NO BID

JAMES C. HAILEY & COMPANY

Consulting Engineers

$343,000.00

NO BID

$629,000.00

$702,133.00

$803,000.00

$269,500.00

360 Cool Springs Boulevard, Suite 100

Franklin, Tennessee 37067-7216

Phone (615) 883-4933  Fax (615) 883-4937

HB & TS UTILITY DISTRICT

CONTRACT 225 - OLD HILLSBORO ROAD & WADDELL HOLLOW ROAD PUMPING STATION IMPROVEMENTS

BID DATE: NOVEMBER 18, 2025

BID TIME:  10:30 A.M., LOCAL TIME

NO BID

$359,500.00

$306,051.00

$460,000.00
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