

**DOUBLE SPRINGS UTILITY DISTRICT
CONTRACT 126 - NEW OFFICE BUILDING & SHOP**

***NEW* BID DATE: AUGUST 17, 2026**

***NEW* BID TIME: 10:00 A.M. LOCAL TIME**

CONTRACTOR	BASE BID	ADD ALTERNATE (SHOP ONLY)
MID-STATE CONSTRUCTION PO BOX 351, 9190 BRADFORD HICKS DR LIVINGSTON, TN 38570 931-823-7345	\$1,334,500.00	\$497,000.00
RT BUILDERS LLC 107 ERVIN DR CARTHAGE, TN 37030 615-701-8010	\$1,358,538.00	\$684,719.00
W & O CONSTRUCTION PO BOX 239, 150 CONSTRUCTION DR LIVINGSTON, TN 38570 931-403-1000	\$1,399,900.00	\$676,000.00
DUDE CONSTRUCTION LLC 5834 GANT RD BAXTER, TN 38544 931-260-1327	\$1,428,000.00	\$632,000.00
RUBICON ENGINEERING SERVICES 2442 N MT JULIET RD MT JULIET, TN 37122 615-380-6345	\$1,577,012.00	\$835,841.00
FTM CONTRACTING 240 MILL DR COOKEVILLE, TN 38501 931-528-1137	\$1,519,500.00	\$677,000.00
LUBIN ENTERPRISES INC 8111 WALNUT RUN RD, STE 208 CORDOVA, TN 38018 901-260-5994	\$1,450,000.00	\$800,000.00
OLG SERVICES LLC 301 INDUSTRIAL BLVD TULLAHOMA, TN 37388 931-454-9940	\$1,862,000.00	\$465,000.00
NOAH ROBERTS CONTRACTING 488 OAKLAND DR SPARTA, TN 38583 931-783-3700	NO BID	NO BID
D & D ENTERPRISES INC 2050 FOUNTAIN CIRCLE COOKEVILLE, TN 38506 931-526-1320	NO BID	NO BID
HD COMMERCIAL LLC PO BOX 1481 COOKEVILLE, TN 38503 931-261-9836	\$1,269,000.00	\$557,000.00

JAMES C. HAILEY & COMPANY
Consulting Engineers
360 Cool Springs Boulevard, Ste 100
Franklin, Tennessee 37067-7216
(ph) 615-883-4933 (fax) 883-4937
www.jchengr.com